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On SOCP/SDP formulation of the extended trust region
subproblem

S. Fallahi *, M. Salahif#, S. Ansary Karbasy?®

Abstract

In this paper, we consider the extended trust region subproblem (eTRS ) which is the
minimization of an indefinite quadratic function subject to the intersection of unit ball
with a single linear inequality constraint. Using a variation of S-Lemma, we derive the
necessary and sufficient optimality conditions for €TRS . Then an SOCP/SDP formulation
is introduced for the problem. Finally, several illustrative examples are provided.
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1 Introduction

Consider the following extended trust region subproblem eTRS

min T Az 4 2a"

lz[* < 1 (1)

vz <p
where AT = A € R™ " is indefinite, a,b € R™ and 8 € R. Since A is indefinite, it is a
nonconvex optimization problem and semidefinite programming (SDP) relaxation is not tight
in general. When b = 0 and 5 = 0, then eTRS reduces to the well-known trust region
subproblem (TRS ) which is the key subproblem in solving nonlinear optimization problems
[4]. Although TRS is a nonconvex problem, it enjoys strong duality and exact SDP relaxation

exists for it [5]. However, the following classical SDP relaxation is not exact for eTRS as it
will be shown also in the numerical results section:

min AeX +2a’x
trace(X) < 1,
bl < B, (2)
X > xal.
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First the authors in [11] have studied eTRS and proposed and exact SOCP/ SDP] formu-
lation for it. Due to the importance of €TRS also in solving general nonlinear optimization
problems, several variants of it have been the focus of current research [I, 2 3] 6, [7, ©]. Beck
and Eldar have studied eTRS under the condition that dim(Ker(A — A\;I)) > 2 which is
equivalent to

A1 = Az, (3)

where A1 and Ay are the two smallest eigenvalues of A. Under this condition, they have shown
that the following optimality conditions are necessary and sufficient optimality conditions for
eTRS :
i) 2(A+ M)z =—(2a+ pub),
(ii) (A+ ) >0,
(i) A(J2ll> =1) =0, p(bTz—B) =0,
(iv) A,u>0.

Jeyakumar and Li in [7] have shown that dim( Ker(A — A\11,)) > 2, together with the Slater
condition ensures that a set of combined first and second-order Lagrange multiplier conditions
are necessary and sufficient for the global optimality of eTRS and consequently for strong
duality. In [6] the authors have improved the dimension condition by Jeyakumar and Li under
which eTRS admits an exact semidefinite relaxation. They proposed the following condition

rank ([A — M\, b)) <n-—1. (4)

It should be noted that TRS has at most one local-nonglobal minimum (LNGM ) [§],
which is a candidate for the optimal solution of eTRS if it is feasible. An efficient algorithm
for computing LNGM is given in [10]. All the above rank conditions guarantee that the global
solution of eTRS does not happen at the LNGM of TRS . Most recently in [2] the authors have
studied eTRS and derived the SOCP/SDP reformulation given in [I1] by different approach
and extended it the cases where more than one linear constraint exist. In this paper, using
a variation of S-Lemma, first we derive the necessary and sufficient optimality conditions for
eTRS which leads us to an SOCP/SDP formulation of it. Then we prove that our derived
formulation is the dual of the formulation presented in [2, 1I]. Finally, we present several
numerical examples illustrating various cases that may happen for the optimal solution of
eTRS .

2 Global Optimality Conditions for eTRS

We define the dual cone of S as S* = {y : (y,z) > 0,Vz € S}. The following proposition
which is variant of S-Lemma, plays a key role in the proof of the optimality conditions.

Proposition 2.1. Let f,g : R — R be quadratic functions, g(z) = 2T Agx + a,Tx + ¢4,
and let b € R", and € R. Moreover, assume that g(x) is convex and there ezists an T € R™
such that b'% < 8 and g(Z) < 0. Then the following two statements are equivalent:

'Second order cone program/Semidefinite program



1. The system

f(z) <0,
g(z) <0,
vz < B,

reR”?

is not solvable.

2. There is a nonnegative multiplier y > 0, a scalar ug € R and vector u € R™ such that

f(x) +yg(x) + (w'z —up)(bTz — B) >0, Vac R,
u€e{reR": l‘TAg$ < O,ang <0},

(?) € {<ZO> cxp=—1,9(x) < 0,cg+ang < 0} .

Proof. See [11], Corollary 7]. O
Corollary 2.1. When g(x) = ||z||* — 1, then the second item in Proposition 1 is equivalent
to

f(@) +yg(x) + (W'z —up)(bTz — B) >0, VzeR",

—U
( ’LLO> € Ln—l—la

where L,11 is the Lorentz cone defined as follows:
Lnt1 = {z = (20;7) € R"™!| ||Z < o}

In the following theorem, we give the optimality conditions for €TRS . Our proofs follows
the idea in [7].

Theorem 2.1. Suppose that the strict feasibility constraint holds for € TRS :
3z € R" with ||2]|> =1 <0, bT& -8 <O0.

Moreover, let * be a feasible point for eTRS . Then z* is a global minimizer of eTRS if, and
only if, there exist A\g € Ry and (—ug,u) € L™ such that the following conditions hold:

o (i) (2A 42X + bu” + ub")z* = —(2a — Bu — buy),
o (ii) Ao(llz*[* = 1) = 0, (u"z* — uo)(b"a* — B) =0,
o (iii) (24 + 2T + bu® + ubT) = 0.

Proof. [Necessity| Let z* be a global minimizer of eTRS . Then the following system of
inequalities has no solution:

l‘TAZE—|—2aT$—|—’7 <0,
lz[* ~ 1 <0,
bl < B,



where v = —(z*T Az* + 2aT2*). Thus by Proposition 2] there exist A9 > 0 and a vector
(ug;u) € R™1 such that

e Az + 207z + v+ (2> = 1) + (uTz —up)(b'z — B) >0, VoeR"
and uTx —ug >0, Vz e R":|z|? <52 Let x = 2%, then we have
No(ll#7]12 = 1) + (7" — o) (B72" — ) > 0.
Now as z* is feasible for eTRS and Ao > 0, (u”z* —ug) > 0, it follows that
o([lz*]]? — 1) =0, (uTz* — ug)(bT'2* — B) = 0.

Let
he) = o Az + 2072 + Mol — 1) + (" — uo) (B — B),

then obviously z* is a global minimizer of h, and so Vh(x*) = 0 and V2h(z*) = 0 i.e.,
(24 4 2X\oT + bu” + ub")z* = —(2a — Bu — buy),

(24 4 2X\o1 + bu” + ub™) = 0.

Thus all conditions (i), (ii) and (iii) hold.
[Sufficiency] If the optimality conditions hold, then from (ii) we see that

hz) = 2" Az +2a"z + o([|al* = 1) + (u"z —uo) 0"z — B)

is convex. Moreover, from condition (i), we have Vh(z*) = 0, therefore, z* is a global
minimizer of h. Thus for given Ay and (ugp;u) in the optimality conditions and for any
feasible solution of eTRS , we have

T Az 42072 > 2T Az 4 207z + No(||z)]* — 1) + Tz — up) (0" 2 — B),
> 2T Az + 20Tz + Xo(|l2*))? — 1) + (W z* — up) (b z* — )
= 2T Az + 247 2"

This implies that z* is a global minimizer of eTRS . U

Theorem 2.2. Suppose that there exists T € R™ with ||z||> —1 < 0 and b'Z — 3 < 0. Then,
we have

min {:ETAx + 20Tz |jz|? < 1,072 < 6}

=  max min{xTAa:+2aTx+)\o(|]xH2 —-1)+ (uTx—uo)(bTa:—B)},
AQZO,(UQ,U)ES z

where
S = {(uo;u)‘(uTx —ug) >0, Vaz:l|z|>< 1}

and the maximum is attained.



Proof. Tt is easy to see that, for every feasible point of eTRS , and every Ao > 0 and (ug, u) €
S,
2T Az + 202 > 2T Az + 202 + No(||z]]® = 1) + (ul'z — up) (0T z — B).

Therefore

min {:ETAx + 20Tz |jz|? < 1,072 < 6}

>  max min{xTAa:+2aTa:+)\o(|]xH2 —-1)+ (uTx—uo)(bTa:—B)}.
A()ZO,(U(),U)ES T

To show the reverse inequality, let z* be a global minimizer of eTRS , then there exists
Ao € Ry and (ug,u) € S such that the following condition holds:

o (24 + 2ol + bul + ub?)a* = —(2a — Bu — buy),
o Xo(Jl2*|]* = 1) = 0 and (u"z* — up)(b"2* — §) =0,
o (2A +2)oI + bul +ub?) = 0.
We see that
h(z) = 2T Az + 2aTx + No(||z]|? = 1) + (uTz — ug) (b7 2 — B),
is convex, Vh(z*) = 0 and V2h(z*) = 0. Therefore, z* is a global minimizer of h i.e.,
T Az 4 20Tz + No(||z)]> — 6%) + (uF'z — ug) (b z — )
> 2T Ax* 4+ 20" + No(||2¥]]? = 1) + (uT'2* — up) (072" — B)
= 2T Ax* + 2aT 2"
Therefore

min{xTAa: +2aTx: |z|> < 1,07z < ﬂ}

< . T T 2 T, T
< oo min {:p Az +2aTz + No(|z))? = 1) + (T — uo) (b7 x ﬁ)}.

O

As we see, in general strong duality does not hold for eTRS which is the reason to rank
conditions given in [, [6l [7] to guarantee it.

Corollary 2.2. If u =0 and ug # 0, then strong duality holds for €eTRS .

Proof. 1t follows from the previous theorem. O

Form Theorem 2.2, we further have

. T T 2 T, T,
o min {;L« Az + 2472 + Mo(|z))? = 1) + (uT'z — uo) (b7 5)}

= maxz
—Xo + Bug — 2 1 (2a — Pu — buo)T
1 2 =0, (5)
5 (2a — Bu—bug) A+ NI + 5 (bu” +ub?)
[ull < —uo,
Ao >0,



which is an SOCP /SDP formulation for eTRS . In what follows, we show that this formulation
is the dual of the SOCP/SDP formulation given in [2, [11]. Consider the Lagrange function
of ([B):

—Xo + Bug — =z % (2a — fu — buo)T T [ —U0
= Y
L(Y,v,u,up, Ao, 2) = 2 + <% (20— Bu—bug) A+ Aol + 1 (b +ubT)) ® T

where Y = 0 and ||v]| < vg. Let also

Thus the Lagrangian can be written as

1
L(Y,v,u,ugp, N, 2) = z + <A+)\OI+ 3 (buT—i—ubT)) e X + (2a — fu — buo)Tx

+« (—)\0 + Bug — Z) + oTu — VoUQ
—AeX +2aTx+ (1 —a)z+ Ao (trace(X) — a) + (Xb— Bz + ) u
+ (=bTz — o + B)ug.

Therefore, the Lagrangian dual becomes

min max L(Y,v,u,ugp, Ao, 2)
a .Z'T A0>0, HuHS—uo
- x| lI5]|<vo
= min max AeX +2aTx 4+ (1 —a)z+ Ao (trace(X) — a)
a .Z'T A0>0, HuHS—uo
- x| [17]|<vo

+ (Xb — Bx + ) u+ (=b"x — vo + Bug
= min G(X,z,a),

_07 CHIRSCN]
X X

G(X,z,a) = max AeX +2aTx+ (1 —a)z+ A (trace(X) — a)
X020, [|ul|<—uo

+(Xb — Bz + ) u+ (=0T x — vy + aB)ug.
We further have

AeX +2aTx, if 1—a=0, trace(X) —a <0,
G(X,z,a) = Xb—pBr+05=0 —blz—vg+5>0

0, 0.W



Thus Lagrangian dual becomes
min AeX +2d z
trace(X) —1 <0,
Xb—px+v=0,

— bl —v+ B3>0, (6)
[[9]] < vo,
Xtm:T.
From (@) we have:
v = fBx — Xb,
vo < —bTx + 3,
18]] < vo = [|7]| = |82 — Xb]| < wvo < —b"a + 5.

Therefore (@) can be written as follows:
min AeX + 24",
trace(X) < 1,
18z — Xbl| < =0T + B, (7)
X > xax’.
This SOCP/SDP formulation is exactly the one given in [2, 11| but our derivation is com-
pletely different.

Corollary 2.3. If at the optimal solution of (1), X* =«
optimal for ().

)T, then z*

(‘,L' socp/sdp &

* *
socp/sdp\” socp/sdp

2.1 Rank one decomposition procedure

In order to derive an optimal solution for eTRS from the none-rank one solution of (), here
we give a rank one decomposition approach similar to the one in [12]. Let X* be an optimal
solution for ([7]) which is not rank one and consider the following notations:

Y* = 1 <$:ocp/sdp)T = <1 0 >7 9= <5 >

* * —1 —
:Esocp/sdp X 0 " b

Obviously we have

_ ngj*
5 socp/sdp ) — Y*g € Ln-i-l,

* * T  x
||5xsocp/sdp - X b|| < -b xsocp/sdp +8 = (lﬁx:ocp/sdp — X*D

trace(X*) <1 <= JeY*>0.

Lemma 2.1 ([12]). Let G be an arbitrary symmetric matriz and X be a positive semidef-
inite matriz with rank r. Further suppose that G ¢ X > 0. Then there exists a rank-one
decomposition for X such that
T
X = Za:,a:;f
i=1



and ZEZTG$Z' >0 foralli=1,---,r. If, in particular, G « X = 0, then x;prxi = 0 for all
i=1,---,7.

The following case may occur:
Case 1. Y*g = 0. From Lemma 2] there exists a rank one decomposition for Y* as
follows:

T

Yr =3 W),

i=1

where r is the rank of Y* such J e [(y/)(y;)"] > 0 for all ¢ = 1,...,r. Morover, J o
[(y;k)(y:)T] =0foralli=1,...,rif JeY* =0. We may choose the sign of the y; to ensure
that yi € L1, 0 =1,...,7.

bt
(2

Since y; € Lyp4+1 and y; # 0, we have t; > 0,¢=1,...,r. Take any 1 < j < r; it follows that

(g*l/t*> (1 [g;/t]7) is optimal for (7).
i/l
Case 2. JeY* > (0 and Y*g # 0. Due to the complementarity condition, we must

. . . tr\ .
By linear independence of y}’s, we get g7y =0,i=1,...,r. Let y} = < ! >, i=1,...,7r.

—k
g

ty > 0. Moreover, J e [y;(y;)T] = (t;)2 - ||37;||2 >0, and y;(y;)Tg = (¢"Y*a)Y*a € Ly1.

Therefore, % (yx)" /(t)? is optimal for (7)) as it is feasible and satisfies the complementarity

conditions.

Case 3. JeY* =0 and Y*g # 0. Denote y; := Y*g # 0. Let Y =Y*— Y;gg/i);* = 0. It

have A\g = 0. Let y; := Y7¥g = <t9 > Since y; € Ln41 by feasibility, we know that

is easy to see that Vg = 0.
Case 3.1. J e [y;(y;)T] = 0. In this subcase, we have that y’gk(y’gk)T/(t;)2 is optimal for
@

Case 3.2. J e [y;(y;)T] > 0. In this subcase,
JeY =JeY* —Je [y;(y;)T] /gt Y*g < 0. (8)

Now let us decompose Y as

s

=1

where s = rank(Y) > 0. Since Yg = 0, we have §lg =0, forall i =1,...,s. Choose j such
that

Je; (5;)" <0.
Such j must exist due to (8). Consider the following quadratic equation:
* ~ * ~\T
J o | (s +am) (v; +ap)" | = 0.

This equation has two distinct real roots with opposite signs. Choose the one such that the
first component of y; + ay; is positive. Denote

* . t*
Yy T 0yj = (y*)



In this case, since J o [y’gk (y;)T] > 0 it follows that yj is in the strict interior of the cone

Ly+1. Due to the complementarity, we must have (uj;u*) = 0. Let us consider the solution
<y*1/ t*) (1 (g*/ t*)T). It is easy to check that this solution is both feasible and complemen-

tary to the dual optimal solution (A§; uf; u*), thus optimal for ().

3 Numerical examples

The aim of this section is to provide various examples explaining different cases that might
occur for the optimal solution of eTRS .

Example 3.1. Consider the following example:

4 0 0 —4 20
A=|0 12 0)a=(0)b=| 8 |,6=1 8=5.
0 0 11 0 ~14

We have A\; = —4 and dim Ker (A — A\pin(A)1,) = 1 # 2, thus the dimension condition (J)
fails to hold. Moreover, the new dimension condition given in [6] also fails to hold, since

0 0 0 20
rank ([A— M1, b)=(0 8 0 8 |=3«2.
0 0 7 —14

The optimal objective value of SDP relaxation (2) is —7.6827. The global solution of TRS
is z = [1,0,0]" which is infeasible for eTRS and LNGM of TRS is 2} = [~1,0 ,0]” which
is feasible for eTRS with the objective value 4.0000. Moreover, for (), the optimal solution
8 T jedp = [0.6266, —0.2169,0.4140]7 and X* = T tpep /s T roep)s dp)T. Thus 7, /., 18
optimal for (II) with objective value —4.1329. As we see, the classical SDP relaxation (Z2I)
is not exact for this example and subsequently strong duality fails to hold. Also it is worth
to note that at the optimal solution, the linear constraint is active while the trust region

constraint is not active.

Example 3.2. Consider the following example:

—4 0 0 0.5714 —17
A=|0 5 o|a=| 0 | b= 14| 6=1, B=44.
0 0 3 0 -2

We have A\; = —4 and dim Ker (A — A\pin(A)1,) = 1 # 2, thus the dimension condition (J)
fails to hold for this example as well. Also the new dimension condition [6] fails to hold here,
since

0 0 0 -17
rank ([A— M1, b)=(0 5 0 14 |=3«2.
0O 0 3 -2
The global solution of TRS is xj = [—1,0,0]7 which is infeasible for eTRS and LNGM of

TRS is 27 = [1 ,0 ,0]7 which is feasible for €TRS with the objective value —2.4972. The



optimal objective value of SDP relaxation (2]) is —5.4326 and the optimal objective value
of SOCP/SDP formulation () is —2.4972 which is also the optimal objective value of ().
Moreover, for (7)), the optimal solution is Z socp/sap™ = [1 50 ,0/" and X* = :E:OCP /s dp(:E:ocp /s dp)T
and thus :E:ocp Jsdp is optimal for (). Here also strong duality fails to hold like the previous
example. Finally, at the optimal solution, the linear constraint is not active while the trust

region constraint is active.

Example 3.3. Consider the following example where at optimality both constraints are active:

-4 0 0 0 4
A=10 -8 0 a=[2287), b=(-15),6=1, g=4.
0 0 2 0 18

Here we have \y = —8 and dim Ker (4 — \pin(A)I,) = 1 # 2, thus the dimension condition
(4) fails to hold. Moreover, the new dimension condition of [6] also fails to hold, since

4.0 0 4
rank ([A—MI, b)=(0 0 0 —15]=3¢2
0 0 10 18

The global solution of TRS is zj = [0,—1,0]” which is infeasible for €eTRS and LNGM
of TRS is z; = [0 ,1 ,0]7 which is feasible for eTRS with the objective value —3.4286.
The optimal objective value of SDP relaxation (2] is —11.0642 and the optimal objective
value of SOCP/SDP formulation ([7) is —9.7551 which is also the optimal objective value

of (M. The optimal solution of (@) is x7,,, .4, = [-0.2885, —0.8567, ~0.4276]" and X* =
* * T * . .
xSOCp/Sdp(xsocp/sdp) 5 thus xsocp/sdp 1S Optlmal fOI' (m)

In all three examples above, the optimal solution of ([7]) is rank one, thus we easily have
the solution of (Il). However, this is not the case in general as illustrated by the following
example.

Example 3.4. Let

—4 0 0 0.5714 -6
A=[0 1 0 a=| 0 | b=[-3]6=1 8=22
0 0 -3 0 0

We have A\; = —4 and dim Ker (A — M\pin(A)1,) = 1 # 2, thus the dimension condition (J)
does not hold. Moreover, the new dimension condition [6] also fails to hold, since

0 0 0 —6
rank (([A— XM\, b)=[0 5 0 —-3]=3«£2.
0O 0 1 0

The global solution of TRS is z* = [~1,0,0]7 which is again infeasible for eTRS and LNGM
of TRS is Z = [1 ,0 ,0]” which is feasible for eTRS with the objective value —2.8572. The
optimal objective value of SDP relaxation (2]) is —5.4354 and the optimal objective value of
SOCP/SDP formulation (7)) is —3.6121 which is also the optimal objective value of (I]). The
optimal solution of (7)) is

0.1842  —0.0537 0 —0.4292
X*=|-0.053 0.0156 0 | @loepjeap = | 01251 |,
0 0 0.8001

10



which obviously X* # :Ezocp /s dp(xzocp /s dp)T. By the rank-one decomposition procedure dis-

cussed in the previous section, one gets the optimal solution z* = [—0.4292,0.1251, —O.8945]T

for ().

4 Conclusions

In this paper, using a variant of S-Lemma, we presented the necessary and sufficient opti-
mality conditions for the extended trust region subproblem that led us to an SOCP/SDP
reformulation for it. Our derived formulation turned out to be the dual of the SOCP/SDP
formulation given in [2] [I1] but with a completely different approach. Extending this idea for
several linear inequality constraints could be an interesting future research direction.
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